NYS Department of State

Division of Corporations

Entity Information

The information contained in this database is current through November 3, 2011.

Selected Entity Name: VIETNAM VETERAN COALITION INC.
Selected Entity Status Information
Current Entity Name: VIETNAM VETERANS OF AMERICA, INC.
Initial DOS Filing Date: MARCH 01, 1978
County: NEW YORK

Jurisdiction: NEW YORK

Entity Type: DOMESTIC NOT-FOR-PROFIT CORPORATION
Current Entity Status: ACTIVE

Selected Entity Address Information
DOS Process (Address to which DOS will mail process if accepted on behalf of the
entity)
NONE
Registered Agent
NONE

This office does not record information regarding the names and addresses of officers,
shareholders or directors of nonprofessional corporations except the chief executive
officer, if provided, which would be listed above. Professional corporations must include
the name(s) and address(es) of the initial officers, directors, and shareholders in the initial
certificate of incorporation, however this information is not recorded and only available
by viewing the certificate.

*Stock Information

# of Shares Type of Stock $ Value per Share
No Information Available



CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

]

OF
VIETNAM VETERAN COALITION INC.

(Under Section 402 of the Not-for-Profit Corporation Law)

The undersigned, acting as incorporator of a corporation
under the New York Not-for-Profit Corporation Law do hereby adopt
the following Certificate of Incorporation.

| ARTICLE I
The name of the Corporation is VIETNAM VETERAN COALITION INC.
ARTICLE II

The Corporation is not organized for pecuniary profit or
financial gain, and no part of its assets, income or profit shall
be distributable to or inure to the benefit of its members, directors
or officers, except to the extent permitted under the Not-for-Profit
Corporation Law and no part of the assets or net earnings of the
Corporation shall be used in a manner or for purposes that do not
comply with the reguirement of Sections 501 (c) (19) and 170(c) (3)
for exclusively charitable and educafional purposes of the United
States Internal Revenue Code, as amended.

ARTICLE III

The purposes for which the Corporation is organized are as
follows:

a) To operate exclusively foir charitable and educational
purposes including b _ut not limited fo the improvement of the condition
of the Vietnam Veteran.

b) To promote social welfare including educational, economic,
social, physical and cultural improvement in the United States.

¢) To study on a non partisan basis proposed legislation or
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rules and regulations introduced in any Federal, State or Local
Legislative or Administrative body which may affect the social,
economic, educational or physical welfare of the Vietnam Veteran.

d) To provide assistance to groups interested in the develop-
ment of programs to meet the economic and social needs of Veterans in
such areas as employment, education, training, outreach and counseling.

e) To assist disabled and needy War Veterans including, but
not limited, to the Vietnam Veteran, and their dependents and the
Widows and Orphans of deceased Veterans.

f) To exercise all the powers conferred upon Corporations
formed under the-New York Not-for-Profit Corporation Law in order
to accomplish its charitable and educational purposes.

g) Nothing contained herein shall authorize this corporation
directly or indirectly to engage in or include among its purposes any
of the activities mentioned in the Not-for—Profit Corporation Law,
Section 404(b) thru (t) inclusive.

ARTICLE IV

This Corparation is a corporation as defined in subparagraph (a)
(5) of Section 102 of the Not-for-Profit Corporation Law and shall be a
Type B Corporation under Section 201 of the Not-for-Profit Corporation Law.

~ ARTICLE V

The office of the Corporaticn is to be located in the City,
County and State of New York; and the activities of the Vietnam
Veteran Coalition Inc. a;;‘principally to be conducted in and
throughout the United States of America.

ARTICLE VI
The number of Directors const;tuting the initial Board of

Directors of the Corporation is three and the names and addresses
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of the persons who are to serve as the initial arectors are

NAME ADDRESS
ROBERT O. MULLER 17 Stonywell Court

Dix Hills, New York 11746

GREGORY KANE 844 Elda Lane
Westbury, New York 11590

MORTIMER M. ROTHSTEIN 19 Crescent View
Rock Hill, New York 112775

ARTICLE VII
) The Board of Directors, in addition to the powers authorized
by statute, shall have the following powers:

a) To adopt by-laws including therein provisions fixing
the method of election and the terms of office of directors
and to change the number of directors.

b) To designate the class and type of members, qualifca-
tions and rights of the members of each class and type and to
make provisions conferring, limiting or denying the right to
vote of members, except, however, that the eligibility require-
ments for the members of the Corporation shall meet the member-
ship requirements of Section 501 (c) (19) (B) of the Internal

Revenue Code and the Regulations promulgated thereunder.

ARTICLE VIII

The duration of the Corporation is to be perpetual.
ARTICLE IX —

The Post Office address to which the Secretary of State

shall mail a copy of any notice required by law is ¢/o




MORTIMER M. ROTHSTEIN, 475 Park Avenue South, New York, N.Y. 10016
ARTICLE X

All abprovak or consenfs required by law will be endorsed

upon or annexed to this Certificate prior to the filing of same.
ARTICLE XI

The Corporation shall not possess or exercise any power
or authority either expressly, by interpretation, or by operation
of law that will prevent it at any time from gqualifying and contin-
uing to qualify either as a corporation exempt from Federal income
tax as an organization described in Section 501 (c) (19) of the
Internal Revenue Code or as a Corporation, contributions to which
are deductible under Section 170 (c) (3) of the Internal Revenue
Code; nor shall it engage directly or indirectly in any activity
which would cause the loss of such qualification,

At no time shall the Corporation engage in any activities which
are unlawful under the laws of the United States of America, the State
of New York or any other jurisdiction where its activities are car-
ried on.

The Corporation will adhere to and comply with Article 7a
of the Executive Law.,

No compensation, loan or other payment shall be paid to any
officer, Board member, incorporator or organizer of the Corporation
or substantial contributor to it, except as reasonable compensation
for services rendered and/or as a reasonable allowance for author-
ized expenditures incurred on behalf of the Corporation; and no
part of the assets or net earnings, current or accumulated, of

the corporation shall ever be distributed to or divided among such




persons or inure, be used for, accrue to or benefit any person or

private individuals.
Upon the termination, dissolution or winding dp of the

corporation in any manner, for any reason, its assets, if any,
remaining after payment, or provision for payment, of all liabil-
ities of the corporation shall be distributed to, and only to, one

or more organizations having either exclusively charitable, religious,

scientific, or educational purposes

only- — as described in Sections 501 (¢} (3), —

and (19) of the Internal Revenue Code, as amended subject to the
order of the Supreme Court of the State of New York
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have signed and acknowledged this

Certificate of Incorporation this 15th day of February, 1978.

R
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A S u.'" /r/:/.?":/
ROBERT 0. MULLLR, Incorporator
Address: 17 Stony;well Court
Dix Hills, New York 11746

STATE OF NEW YORK )
COUNTY OF NEW YORK )ss.:

On the 15th day of February, 1978, before me personally
came ROBERT O. MULLER, to me known to be the individual described
in and who executed the foregoing Certificate of Incorporation

and duly acknowledged that he executed e same.
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Commissun Do Maroh o, 1978
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SUPREME COURT : STATE OF NEW YORK
COUNTY OF NEW YORK

IN THE MATTER OF THE
INCORPORATION

of
VIETNAM VETERAN COALITION INC.

Pursuant to the Not-for-Profit
Corporation Law

————————————— - e = = -y

; NATHANIEL T. HELMAN

/ a Justice of the Supreme
Court of the State of New York in the First Judicial District
wherein the principal office of Vietnam Veteran Coalition Inc.
is to be located, do hereby approve the within Certificate of
Incorporation of Vietnam Veteran Coalition Inc. and consent

that the same be filed.

Dated: New York, February 205, 1978

P —

Justice of the Supreme Court
First Judieial District

NATHANIEL T. HELMAN

R
-~

THE UNDERSIGNED HAS NO
ORJECTION TO THE GRANTING
OF JUDICIAL APPROVAL
HEREON AND WAIVES
STATUTORY NOTICE

S
et

10UIS J. LEFKOWITZ
Attornoy General
State of New York

e L I

ppoiatant Attormey Generdl
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